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A conflict between some tribesmen and the Saudi regime over land earmarked for development has garnered much
attention from the media as of late. Saudi Crown Prince Mohammad bin Salman plans to construct a futuristic “smart
city” called Neom, in the northwestern Tabuk province of Saudi Arabia adjacent to the Red Sea. This would require
the application of the controversial law of eminent domain to appropriate land that has traditionally been the home to
an Arabian tribe known as the Howeitat (al-Ḥuwayṭāt). A number of Howeitat tribesmen have paid a high price for
defying eviction orders or protesting the development plans. One was killed in a confrontation with Saudi security
forces, three face harsh prison sentences and three face execution. Much of the media attention has focused on the
trampling of human rights. An important angle of the story that has not received much attention is the infighting
between different members of the Howeitat tribe.

The conflict centers around the land on which the megacity “Neom” is being built. The Neom project has been
depicted as “the city of the future” replete with flying taxis, robotic maids, and an eco-friendly habitat functioning off of
solar and wind energy. To understand how Neom is driving a wedge between different factions of the Howeitat, it is
critical to understand that Neom is just one component of Bin Salman’s “Vision 2030.” Vision 2030 is an ambitious
plan to prepare the Kingdom for a low-carbon future by diversifying the production of goods and services, developing
the private sector, and fostering a self-sufficient economy that will support the standard of living that citizens have
become accustomed to. Another integral aspect of Bin Salman’s drive to prepare Saudi Arabia for the transition away
from the oil rentier economy and toward a market-based economy is the promotion of territorial nationalism in a
country in which it has always been weak. For Bin Salman, strengthening nationalist sentiment involves attenuating
some tribal and religious power centers and strengthening the direct linkages between the state and its citizens. This
article will apply insights about tribal politics drawn from the anthropological literature about tribes in the Arabian
Peninsula and present the Howeitat’s response to Neom as a case study that can shed light on the changing
relationship between tribes and the Saudi state under the new leadership of Crown Prince Mohammad bin
Salman.           

Mohammad bin Salman will one day inherit the throne held by his elderly father, King Salman, but he is widely
regarded as the Kingdom’s de facto ruler, owing to the suspicion that his father has been incapacitated by dementia.
Mohammad bin Salman will be the youngest to rule Saudi Arabia and he will also be the first grandson of Abdulaziz
ibn Al Saud (Ibn Saud), the Kingdom’s founder, to inherit the throne. Until now, Ibn Saud’s predecessors have all
been his sons. Poised to rule for the next fifty years or so, Bin Salman faces the unique challenge of maintaining
domestic stability and regime security during the era in which the world moves away from fossil fuels and toward
renewable sources of energy. Since the discovery of oil in 1938, the Saudi royal family and its state apparatus have
used oil to maintain stability by providing an extensive social welfare system as well as employment in the security
services and public sector. Public sector jobs are mediated by patron-client relationships with tribes, clans and
important business families. For example, the patron-client relationship between the Al Saud and the Howeitat is
prominently expressed in the inclusion of the Howeitat in the Saudi Arabian National Guard.

The Howeitat are a large tribe whose traditional territory fans out from Aqaba in all directions. Today they inhabit
Saudi Arabia, Jordan, Israel, Egypt and Iraq. The Abu Tayyi segment hails from a group of camel-breeding nomads
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that played a prominent role in the “Arab Revolt” during WWI under the leadership of ‘Awda Abu Tayy. An early
history (Peake 1958, 212-14) tells us that their historical rivals, the Ibn Jazi, were a semi-sedentary branch of the
Howeitat that dwelled north of Aqaba. The oppositionists to Neom hail from the al-Taqiqa segment whose shaykhs
traditionally ruled from Duba and became settled along the Red Sea coast before the First World War.   

The creation of the Palestine Mandate after WWI, and its subsequent partition into Palestine and Transjordan, laid a
new colonially determined and arbitrary boundary through the desert and through the tribal abode of the Howeitat.
The new lines on the map neither reflected nor determined the political orientation of the tribes nor did they obstruct
their movements. Joseph Kostiner (1993, 129-30) who chronicled the role of tribes in the establishment of the Saudi
state tells us that the Abu Tayy section supported Ibn Saud though they dwelled in the Emirate of Transjordan. The
history of the tribe in the early 1930s was characterized by shifting allegiances and cross-border raiding, especially
from the north to the south. When the Al Saud from the Najd conquered the Hijaz they subsequently divided it into
administrative districts. The al-Taqiqa tribal land was circumscribed within the Duba district and later attached to the
Tabuk Province. In 1932 the Kingdom of Hejaz and Najd was unified as the Kingdom of Saudi Arabia.

Due to their migratory way of life, the collective identity and organization of tribes have been remarkably resilient even
as modern boundaries have been drawn and state structures have swallowed up the land that they have traditionally
dwelled in. The Howeitat are a pertinent example. Though they found themselves straddling new borders, they
maintained their tribal values and did what they needed to do to survive in the traditional sense and as a unit. Ibn
Khaldun, the renowned 14th century Arab historian, explained in his seminal work, the Muqaddimah, that Bedouin
place high value on ʿasabiyya, the social cohesion of the kinship group. Bedouin also have a special relationship with
the desert. The solitude of the desert provided a means by which tribes could most effectively preserve their
autonomy and distinctiveness as a social unit. Its harsh environment and limited resources taught them to move
about in search of grazing lands for their livestock, water sources, and favorable climactic conditions. Migration
patterns also brought them in contact with settled populations with whom they engaged in trade and exchange;
however, nomads regarded the settled lifestyle with contempt and extolled their own way of living as superior and as
the way that people were created to live. Traditionally, they addressed their need for security and quest for autonomy
by entering into ad hoc arrangements with other tribes as well as local and external political actors. These
arrangements were temporary transactions, whose dynamics were shaped by the relative power of one group to
another and the tribal balance of power in the area. As states were carved out of the Arabian Peninsula, new power
centers were consolidated, and hydrocarbon-based rentier economies took shape, Bedouin often resisted
urbanization, and continued in their traditional livelihoods. Even as individual tribesmen became de facto citizens of
states, they maintained and prioritized their association with their kinship group, ranking tribal identity and solidarity
as the most important social and political marker in their dealings with each other and with outsiders.

When it consolidated power, the House of Saud infused the state ethos with tribal values, placed an emphasis on its
own tribal identity in the national narrative, and relied on patronage and tribal modes of administration for political
legitimacy. At the outset, tribes and the Saudi state enjoyed a relatively symbiotic relationship that involved give and
take on all sides. Subsequent processes, such as the consolidation of the oil-based economy, urbanization,
globalization and changing gender roles, have slowly eroded the this “social contract” as well as the salience of
kinship ties. Today, Mohammad bin Salman, is writing a new chapter in this process as he works to centralize power
in his own hands while at the same time modernize the country. Bin Salman’s policies have sought to weaken and
control older structures such as the Wahhabi establishment, clientelist business networks and tribes. An integral part
of that drive has been his promotion of civic nationalism as a solidarity framework and point of reference that is more
modern and thus superior to Wahhabism and tribalism. This nationalization campaign which has been waged in
digital, economic, social and cultural arenas connects nationalism with the future and coalesces handily with futuristic
projects such as Neom. The futuristic smart city is being promoted by Saudi royals as a “great victory for the Saudi
nation.”

Modernity, however, is a two-edged sword; it cuts both ways. The modern experience has also strengthened the
bonds of solidarity within tribes. For example, the rise of social media and digital platforms has enabled tribes to unite
and communicate more efficiently than ever. Tribal message boards which have been used to construct and
document tribal lineages and glorify tribal values, have served to reinforce tribal particularism and association even
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as the regime works to promote a broad and inclusive civic identity framework. These digital platforms have also
been used to strengthen the bonds of solidarity within tribes and deliberately counteract the regime’s nationalization
project. Most recently, social media channels such as Twitter, Signal and Telegram have been leveraged by some
members of the Howeitat to fight back against the regime’s seizure of their property.

The Saudi state’s plans to develop its northwestern Tabuk province into a planned linear city styled “Neom,” required
the appropriation of private property through the application of eminent domain. But a lack of transparency and
perceived fairness in the compensation policies has widened divisions within the tribe by enriching the pockets of
some to the tune of up to 1.3 million, while allegedly short-changing others. Some of the dissatisfied tribesmen made
it known that they refused to leave their property and prepared for a confrontation with the security services. Things
escalated very quickly on 13 April 2020 when Saudi security services shot and killed Abdul Rahim al-Hwaiti after
forcing their way into his house, while his supporters viewed a video that he posted to Twitter hours before in which
he anticipated the raid and denounced “state terrorism.” His wife, who launched a protest campaign from London,
posted footage of his funeral, showing that it drew a large crowd despite the presence of state security. In response
to the crisis, ten shaykhs, representing different sub-sections of the Howeitat tribe provided a letter to the Saudi
government which was subsequently published in the Arabic press on 27 April 2020, in which they distanced
themselves from the Howeitat oppositionists, declared allegiance to the King and Crown Prince, expressed their
support for the Neom project and hailed the myriad ways in which Neom would promote human development,
prosperity and progress for generations to come. This was reinforced with a televised “march of loyalty” in which the
“shaykh of shaykhs” Aoun bin Abdullah Abu Taqiqa was interviewed by a television reporter against a backdrop of
camel-mounted tribesmen waving the Saudi flag and displaying a portrait of the King.

Buoyed by the show of support, Bin Salman adopted a decisive and heavy-handed approach toward the Howeitat
youths, sanctioning additional arrests and even the imposition of the death penalty. The London-based Howeitat
opposition appealed to the international community to intervene on humanitarian grounds alleging that they are being
displaced from their traditional tribal land, and that the appropriation of their property is predicated on serious
shortcomings in Saudi Arabia’s laws of eminent domain. They are also calling upon foreign countries and businesses
involved with the Neom project to use whatever leverage they can to protect the human rights of the Howeitat. The
Howeitat number about 40,000 in Saudi Arabia and comprise about 8 percent of the population in the Tabuk
province. The opposition to the Neom project is centered in al-Khurayba and its vicinity, on the coast of the Red Sea
near the border with Jordan, whereas the paramount shaykh is based further south in port Duba, the historical center
of the Huwaitat.

The Neom project and the state’s policies for appropriating the land on which it is being built have deepened a rift
within the Howeitat tribe and undermined the ability of its leadership to lay claim to a powerful constituency. This
gives testament to the erosion of the authority of tribal leaders in Saudi Arabia, especially over young people.
Moreover, the regime is learning that the promotion of nationalism works in antithetical ways. Encouraging civic
engagement and the notion that individuals have responsibilities toward their nation, raises expectations about the
individual rights they ought to enjoy, such as the freedom of expression and freedom of assembly. The case of the
Howeitat’s division over the issue of Neom brings into view the dramatic restructuring of state-society relations and
portends a decidedly weaker role for tribes and kinship groups in Mohammed bin Salman’s “new Saudi Arabia.”
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